
P R E L I M I N A R Y R E M A R K S . 

MEAN T E M P E R A T U R E AT T H E U N D E R M E N T I O N E D P L A C E S - C a. 

P L A C E S . 

Kilmahumaig, P E . I 
Halifax, N.S 
Freder ic ton , N.B 
Montreal , Que 
Toronto, Ont 
Winnipeg, Man 
Regina . N . W . T 
Victoria, B.C 

J u l y . 

65-90 
67-10 
68-51 
73 48 
73-14 
66-52 
62-8 
57-66 

Aug 

61-57 
64-30 
62-64 
65 94 
66-19 
61-03 
60-30 
57-11 

Sept. 

55-08 
56-80 
54-98 
56-38 
56-40 
53-76 
5300 
54-13 

Oct. 

44-45 
48-10 
44-15 
44-30 
44-20 
32-42 
32-70 
47-62 

Nov 

33-96 
38 00 
32-11 
30 00 
35-11 
17-35 
23-20 
42-56 

Dec. 

22-02 
2700 
19-33 
16-84 
28-39 

2-39 
2-50 

41-58 

11 

The average in all cases means the average obtained from 
thirteen years' observation, except where otherwise men­
tioned. The temperature in January was below the average 
for the month in Manitoba, Ontario, Quebec and New Bruns­
wick; at Winnipeg it was as much as 8°'l below. In Nova 
Scotia and British Columbia, the temperature was above the 
average. The lowest temperature was registered at Regina, 
viz., 52- below zero, and the highest at Halifax, 54°"9. In 
February the temperature was below the average at all the 
stations, except a few on Lakes Erie and Ontario ; at Medicine 
Hat, N.W.T., it was 28°'6 below the average of three years. 
The lowest temperature was again registered at Regina, viz., 
48° below zero, and the highest at Yictoria, 59°- In March 
and April the temperature was generally below the average, 
except in the latter month in Manitoba and the North-West. 
In May, June and July the temperature was very generally 
above the average, especially in May when it was univer­
sally so, and the exceedingly hot weather during these three 
months will long be remembered. In Toronto the mean tem­
perature in May was 6D-51 higher than the average of forty-
seven years, and in Montreal 6p'3o higher than the average 
of thirty years. The highest recorded temperature in this 
month was 930-3 at Windsor, Ont. The same temperature 
was recorded at a number of places during the following 


